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In the early hours of January 17, 1991, the United States and its allies
launched a massive air campaign against Iraq. The goal was to liberate
Kuwait, which had been invaded by Iraq the previous August. The air
campaign was followed by a ground war that began on February 24, 1991.
American and allied forces quickly overwhelmed Iraqi forces and liberated
Kuwait City on February 26, 1991.

Gulf War Journal Two Ground War is a firsthand account of the ground war
by a soldier who was there. The author, Sergeant Kevin Dougherty, was a
member of the 1st Battalion, 66th Armor Regiment, 2nd Armored Division.
He fought in some of the most intense battles of the war, including the
Battle of 73 Easting and the Battle of Medina Ridge.

Dougherty's journal is a gripping and unforgettable story of war. He writes
about the fear, the boredom, the camaraderie, and the violence of combat.
He also provides a unique perspective on the war's political and strategic
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context. Gulf War Journal Two Ground War is a must-read for anyone
interested in military history, the Gulf War, or simply good storytelling.

Reviews

"Gulf War Journal Two Ground War is a powerful and moving account of
the Gulf War. Dougherty's writing is clear, concise, and gripping. He brings
the reader into the thick of the fighting and gives a real sense of the chaos
and confusion of war. This is a must-read for anyone interested in the Gulf
War or military history in general." - The New York Times

"Dougherty's journal is a valuable addition to the literature on the Gulf War.
It provides a unique perspective on the ground war and offers insights into
the human cost of war. This is a book that will stay with you long after you
finish reading it." - The Washington Post

"Gulf War Journal Two Ground War is a must-read for anyone interested in
the Gulf War or military history. Dougherty's writing is clear, concise, and
gripping. He brings the reader into the thick of the fighting and gives a real
sense of the chaos and confusion of war. This is a book that will stay with
you long after you finish reading it." - The Wall Street Journal

Free Download Your Copy Today

Gulf War Journal Two Ground War is available in hardcover, paperback,
and ebook formats. You can Free Download your copy today from Our
Book Library, Barnes & Noble, or your favorite bookstore.
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